
VILLA CV-518

VILLA FOR RENT - PEVERO GOLF
PROPERTY CODE: CV-518DETAILS

Bedrooms: 6
Bathrooms: 6
Staff Bedrooms: 1
Staff Bathrooms: 1

OTHER FEATURES

Swimming pool, Sea view, Garden, Conditioned air, Barbecue.



DESCRIPTION

An enchanted villa amidst the hills of Pevero Golf. Its 
granite façade reflects the sun's rays, while its open 
windows look out onto a breathtaking panorama. 
From the balconies and terraces, the gaze is lost in 
the infinite blue of the sea, embracing the bay of 
Cala di Volpe as far as the inlet of Portisco. Here, 
romance materialises amidst the lush greenery of 
the garden and the scent of wild flowers, providing 
unforgettable emotions The villa presents itself as an 
elegant residence with a kitchen that opens to both 
the outdoor and indoor dining areas, allowing for a 
smooth transition between spaces. It has five double 
bedrooms, each with a private bathroom, ensuring 
privacy and comfort for guests. In addition, there is a 
guest bathroom and a luxurious suite with a double 
bedroom, ensuite bathroom and a cosy living room. 
The outdoor kitchen, located at the level of the 
private pool, offers an open-air dining experience in 
an atmospheric setting. The pool can be heated to 
ensure maximum comfort at any time of the year. 
The large surrounding garden adds a touch of 
serenity and relaxation, while the two covered 
parking spaces













SATELLITE VIEW OF THE AREA

The property presented in this brochure can be found in the area depicted in this satellite picture. For privacy reasons we do not 
indicate the exact point on the map. Contact us for more information.
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